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Stop here if you want to be 
an Infant/Toddler or 
Preschool Teacher or an Early 
Childhood Special Education 
Teacher 

Pause here if you want to be 
a TK, Kinder or 1st-grade 
teacher, see an advisor about 
the difference between CHAE 
& CHAS. 
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Stop here if you want to be a 
K-6th grade Teacher and plan 
to pursue a Multiple-Subject 
Credential or a TK-12th 
Special Education (SPED) 
Teacher and plan to pursue a 
Mild/Mod or Extensive 
Support Credential  
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Stop here if you want to be a 
Middle School or High School 
Teacher and plan to pursue a 
Single Subject Credential or 
plan to work with youth in a 
community setting or plan to 
attend a graduate studies 
program with a focus on 
adolescents.
Pause here if you plan to do 
counseling or social work, see 
an advisor about the 
difference between CHAY & 
CHAF.  
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Stop here if you plan to work 
in a community setting (ABA, 
Child Life Specialist), or 
preparing for graduate work 
in  counseling, social work or  
related fields. 

CAS Concentrations: 
Are you in the right concentration? 
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